

ELMIRA WATER BOARD

TYTON JOINT DUCTILE IRON PIPE BIDS - NOVEMBER 01, 2017 / For 2018 Purchases

COMPANY	Forms Yes/ No	PIPE BID PER FOOT												TOTAL PIPE BID
		4" pipe	6" pipe	8" pipe	10" pipe	12" pipe	16" pipe	order 500'		order 4,000'		order 1,000'		
		per foot	per foot	per foot	per foot	per foot	per foot	total	total	total	total	total	per foot	
Blair Supply		16.70	13.00	18.27	23.80	29.97	43.40	8,350.00	52,000.00	18,270.00	23,800.00	5,994.00	2,604.00	111,018.00
E. J. Prescott, Inc.		0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	-	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
F.W. Webb	X	16.26	12.60	17.83	23.35	29.42	42.57	8,130.00	50,400.00	17,830.00	23,350.00	5,884.00	2,554.20	108,148.20
Core and Main		16.58	12.92	18.21	23.74	29.89	43.29	8,290.00	51,680.00	18,210.00	23,740.00	5,978.00	2,597.40	110,495.40
ID Booth - new 2015		0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	-	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
McWane Ductile - new 2015		16.97	13.18	18.60	24.38	30.69	44.42	8,485.00	52,720.00	18,600.00	24,380.00	6,138.00	2,665.20	112,988.20
Vellano Corporation		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid							0.00
2017 Results														
H.D. Supply	YES	15.80	11.80	16.70	21.85	27.55	39.85	7,900.00 500 ft	47,200.00 4,000 ft	16,700.00 1,000 ft	21,850.00 1,000 ft	5,510.00 200 ft	2,391.00 60 ft	101,551.00