

KENNEDY HYDRANTS BIDS - NOVEMBER 01, 2017 / For 2018 Purchases												
COMPANY	Forms Yes/No	5'0" hydrant	order 4	5'6" hydrant	order 15	6'0" hydrant	order 3	6'6" hydrant	order 2	7'0" hydrant	order 2	TOTAL BID
		per hydrant	total	per hydrant	total	per hydrant	total	per hydrant	total	per hydrant	total	
Blair Supply		1,983.00	7,932.00	2,028.00	30,420.00	2,073.00	6,219.00	2,118.00	4,236.00	2,162.00	4,324.00	53,131.00
E. J. Prescott, Inc.		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		-
Core and Main	X	1,980.80	7,923.20	2,024.75	30,371.25	2,068.75	6,206.25	2,112.70	4,225.40	2,156.65	4,313.30	53,039.40
ID Booth new 2015		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		-
McWane Ductile New 2015		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		-
Vellano Corp.		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		-

2017 Results

Blair Supply	1,985.00	7,940.00	2,028.00	30,420.00	2,073.00	6,219.00	2,118.00	4,236.00	2,160.00	4,320.00	53,135.00
--------------	----------	----------	----------	-----------	----------	----------	----------	----------	----------	----------	-----------