

ELMIRA WATER BOARD

GRAVEL BIDS (IN TONS) - NOVEMBER 01, 2017 / For 2018 Purchases

COMPANY	Forms	Aggregate Stone ASTM #57 Delivered	Aggregate Stone ASTM #57 Pick- up	Bedding Sand Delivered	Bedding Sand Pick-up	Select Subbase Delivered	Select Subbase Pick-up		
		per ton	per ton	per ton	per ton	per ton	per ton		
Daggett Sand & Gravel, Inc.		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
Dalrymple Gravel		18.50	16.00	No Bid	No Bid	15.50	13.00		
Edger		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
Rhinehart Sand		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
Seneca Stone		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
T-M-T Gravel	X	16.00	11.50	12.00	7.50	12.50	8.00		
** Winner decided by coin toss 11/5/2015									
2017 Results		Aggregate Stone ASTM #57 Delivered	Aggregate Stone ASTM #57 Pick- up	Bedding Sand Delivered	Bedding Sand Pick-up	Select Subbase Delivered	Select Subbase Pick-up		
Daggett Sand & Gravel, Inc.		12.50		9.50					
Edger			10.75		7.00	9.50	7.75		