

ELMIRA WATER BOARD

GATE WELL BIDS - NOVEMBER 01, 2017 / For 2018 Purchases																		
COMPANY	RDC	5 1/4"x26" top/slide	order 75	5 1/4" cover/ water	order 125	5 1/4"x36" bottom/ slide	order 75	5 1/4"x12 riser	order 200	4 1/4"x19" top/slide	order 40	4 1/4" cover/ water	order 40	4 1/4"x36" bottom/ slide	order 20	18" Extension	order 25	TOTAL BID
		per unit	total	per unit	total	per unit	total	per unit	total	per unit	total	per unit	total	per unit	total	per unit	total	
Blair Supply		30.75	2,306.25	8.25	1,031.25	30.75	2,302.50	15.00	3,000.00	24.00	960.00	5.25	210.00	34.25	685.00	15.25	381.25	10,876.25
E. J. Prescott, Inc.		0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
F.B. Webb		26.70	2,002.50	7.95	993.75	27.27	2,045.25	14.78	2,956.00	19.31	772.40	6.25	250.00	23.86	477.20	14.21	355.25	9,852.35
Core and Main	X	28.85	2,163.75	6.55	818.75	19.75	1,481.25	15.55	3,110.00	21.85	874.00	4.70	188.00	31.95	639.00	15.65	391.25	9,666.00
Ti Sales		55.10	4,132.50	14.67	1,833.75	51.38	3,853.50	42.60	8,520.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	18,339.75
I D Booth new 2015		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		0.00
McWane Ductile new 2015		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		0.00
Vellano Corporation		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		0.00
2017 Results																		
Blair Supply	YES	29.25	2,193.75	6.70	837.50	29.20	2,190.00	13.75	2,750.00	23.00	920.00	4.25	170.00	33.00	660.00	14.50	362.50	10,083.75