

**GATE VALVE BIDS - NOVEMBER 01, 2017 / For 2018 Purchases**

COMPANY	Forms	8571SS 4" order 10		6" order 65		8" order 15		10" order 2		12" order 4		Butterfly 4500 16" order 2		20" order 2		24" order 2		7571 BMSS 16" order 2		20" order 2		24" order 2		7571 BEMSS 30" order 2		Total	
		per unit	total	per unit	total	per unit	total	per unit	total	per unit	total	per unit	total	per unit	total	per unit	total	per unit	total	per unit	total	per unit	total	per unit	total		
Blair Supply		416.00	4,160.00	530.00	34,450.00	845.00	12,675.00	1,315.00	2,630.00	1,660.00	6,640.00	2,395.00	4,790.00	3,650.00	7,300.00	5,020.00	10,040.00	7,350.00	14,700.00	13,075.00	26,150.00	17,999.00	35,998.00	24,700.00	49,400.00	208,933.00	
E. J. Prescott, Inc.		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No bid											
<b>Core and Main</b>	X	415.70	4,157.00	530.50	34,482.50	844.95	12,674.25	1,317.55	2,635.10	1,667.20	6,668.80	2,355.75	4,711.50	3,560.30	7,120.60	4,942.20	9,884.40	7,341.10	14,682.20	13,071.05	26,142.10	17,960.40	35,920.80	24,624.35	49,248.70	208,327.95	
I D Booth		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No bid											
McWane Ductile		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No bid											
Vellano Corporation		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No bid											
<b>2017 Results</b>		order 10 MJ 6" order 65		8" order 15		10" order 12		12" order 4		Butterfly 4500 16" order 2		20" order 2		24" order 2		7571 BMSS 16" order 2		20" order 2		24" order 2		7571 BEMSS 30" order 2		Total			
Blair Supply	YES	437.00	4,370.00	557.00	36,205.00	876.00	13,140.00	1,362.00	2,724.00	1,716.00	6,864.00	2,480.00	4,960.00	3,770.00	7,540.00	5,236.00	10,472.00	7,499.00	14,998.00	13,357.00	26,714.00	18,200.00	36,400.00		25,000.00	50,000.00	214,387.00
<b>Accessory Kits for Valves</b>																											
		8571SS 4" order 10		6" order 65		8" order 15		10" order 2		12" order 4		Butterfly 4500 16" order 2		20" order 2		24" order 2		7571 BMSS 16" order 2		20" order 2		24" order 2		7571 BEMSS 30" order 2		Total	
<b>Core and Main</b>	X	6.25	62.50	7.80	507.00	8.60	129.00	11.30	22.60	12.35	49.40	20.55	41.10	26.55	53.10	29.75	59.50	20.55	41.10	26.55	53.10	29.75	59.50	50.30	100.60		1,178.50
Blair Supply		8.45	84.50	11.70	760.50	13.20	198.00	18.75	37.50	19.71	78.84	32.50	65.00	62.00	124.00	85.50	171.00	32.50	65.00	62.00	124.00	85.50	171.00	155.00	310.00	2,189.34	
<b>New For 2018</b>																											