

CHEMICAL BIDS - NOVEMBER 01, 2017 / For 2018 Purchases

		HYDROFLUOROSILICIC ACID "HFS" PER GAL.	LIQUID CHLORINE 1 TON CYLINDER	POLYHYDROXO- SULFATOALUMINUM CHLORIDE "PAC" PER GAL.	ORTHOPHOSPHAT E PER GAL.	SODIUM HYDROXIDE (Caustic Soda)	SODIUM PERMANGANATE 1,000 gal
Amrex Chemical		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Bison Laboratories, Inc.		-	-	-	-	1.330	-
Brenntag Notheast		-	-	-	-	1.285	-
Carus	X	-	-	-	2.849	-	-
Coyne Chemicals		-	-	-	2.988	-	-
Geo Specialty Chemicals		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Gulbrandsen Technologies		-	-	1.2856	-	-	-
Holland Company	X	-	-	1.040	-	-	-
JCI Jones Chemicals, Inc.	X	-	1,000.000	-	-	1.070	-
Kemira Water		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Kuehne		-	2,000.000	-	-	1.330	-
Shannon Chemical Corp.	X	3.470	-	-	2.934	-	7.370
Slack Chemical Company		3.579	-	1.547	-	1.338	7.150
Thatcher Company of NY	X	3.490	-	-	-	-	7.140
Univar		-	-	-	-	-	-
		HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID "HFS" PER GAL.	LIQUID CHLORINE 1 TON CYLINDER	POLYHYDROXO- SULFATOALUMINUM CHLORIDE "PAC" PER GAL.	ORTHOPHOSP HATE PER GAL.	SODIUM HYDROXIDE (Caustic Soda)	2017 Bid changed from 330 gal to 1,000 gal of 20%
2017 Results							
			-	-	-		-
Holland Company		-	-	1.000	-	-	-
JCI Jones Chemicals, Inc.		-	800.000	-	-	0.880	-
Shannon Chemical Corp.		-	-	-	3.127	-	7.170
Thatcher Chemical		3.600					-

